

LIST OF BID DOCUMENTS RECEIVED

Description of goods/service SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF BITUMEN
 Tender no 02
 Closing date 10 FEBRUARY 2017
 Time 12H00

Name of bidder	Amount
BDA BDA HOLDINGS PTY LTD	5848.2
matyoha construction & Projects	6102.42
Iceburg Trading 751 cc	4768.71
Mvelo-iso Trading & projects	6450.00
Nedmay Trading enterprise	2372.62
Sm tm construction	4100.00
BORUTHO CAS SUPPLY PTY LTD	No Bid price
Pfanoglen consulting & services	7500.00
Mullion Trading and projects	4979.26
IYA Trading and projects (PTY) LTD	4014.70
Tshithandwa trading & cleaning	4400.00
Masana Social Consultants	6840.00
Fsm Holdings (PTY) LTD	3222.78
Skietronii Electro mechanical cc	4068.09
Muimaleli masase construction	4788.00
Wanga Muano General Dealer	4100.00
TWK civil and building constructor	4970.46
Yellow solution Technology cc	4446.00
Chakgahle Trading and projects	4890.60
Mapondho Trading & Projects	5568.00
Phash General Trading	7182.00
cheu P construction	3950
mathezwani construction	5700.00
Syllungile Trading and projects	5700.00
Tondalushaka fruitshop	No total Bid price
RT&O group	4321.67
Thungo general	3222.22
Macansi general Trading	5225.35
Quality Control civil-Build ^{Contract} Engine	4162.80
Bmb consulting Engineers	6418.2
Luhaba maintenance solutions	6156.00
Mountrida Africa PTY LTD	5185.00

P. Mosewe

2017/02/10

Attention

2017-02-10

MAKHADO MUNICIPALITY

COMMENTS

LIST OF BID DOCUMENTS RECEIVED

Description of goods/service

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF BITUMEN

Tender no

02

Closing date

10 FEBRUARY

Time

12H00

Name of bidder	Amount
Emda construction	5564-06
Makhado Cecil Ramathauha	4069-70
HTML Properties (Pty) LTD	4004-80
Mali projects	3876
Rowande Investment	2896.80
Team Lutosh Trading Enterprise	4150-00
Mmangovhale Construction	2194-68
Sitsula Trading and Construction	4800-00
Mkhapeng Trading Enterprise	3933-00
Mbani Funi Trading & projects	5900-00
Madeha Trading Enterprise	4503-00
Phon consulting and project	3824.70
Tshikurufu Trading Enterprise	4810-00
Chesterbury Trading projects	3400-00
Londolani Trading & Publishers	3690-00
IBN international (Pty) LTD	4116-00
Gochi Trading CC	1344-00
Green Asphalt Pty LTD	R88 24
Ecrostax (Pty) LTD	24-05 R4603-32
MC Elegant events	R4104-00
KES Wealth Creation	NO Bid price
Khuphuka construction	NO Bid price
Mabid and son Construction	NO Bid price
Mulungu general Trading	NO Bid price

1. ~~#####~~ etc. 10/02/2017

[Handwritten signatures and scribbles]

Ref:
 Attention:
 2017-02-10
 MAKHADO MUNICIPALITY
 COMMENTS: