

**LIST OF BID DOCUMENTS RECEIVED**

Description of goods/service SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF BITUMEN  
 Tender no TENDER NO 03/2015  
 Closing date 13 FEBRUARY 2015  
 Time 12H00

| Name of bidder   | Amount             |
|--|--------------------|
| 1. Tshiq Tshashu   | R5005-93           |
| 2. Tshete Asphalt  | R3813-10           |
| 3. K.P.G. Surfacing And civil CC                             | R2812-00           |
| 4. Shavhies Building   | No Total Bid Price |
| 5. VN Malivha Trading  | No Total Bid Price |
| 6. Gwabeni Building Enterprise                               | R4098-09           |
| 7. Maemza Erika  | No bid price       |
| 8. Hulelasi Construction                                     | R199250-00         |
| 9. Deluis Construction                                       | No bid Price       |
| 10. Mamuroli General Trading                                 | R3884-00           |
| 11. Wamashuku Developpers                                    | R8330-44           |
| 12. Zathu's Consulting And Trading                           | R2750-00           |
| 13. Portia's Printers Galore                                 | R6964-40           |
| 14. Ndamsa Trading   | R2450-00           |
| 15. Bedrock Trading And projects                             | R5100-00           |
| 16. Nare chuene Trading Enterprise                           | R4617-25           |
| 17. Justen Construction                                      | R8250-00           |
| 18. Rosematha construction                                   | No bid Price       |
| 19. K.G.G. Trading Enterprise                                | R14400-00          |
| 20. Ikamva Nempumelelo/PTY/LTD                               | R3737-78           |
| 21. Strellia Consulting CC                                   | R3300-00           |
| 22. Chesterburg Trading                                      | R3260-00           |
| 23. Bright Future General Trading                            | R4966-56           |
| 24. Megacross IT SOLUTIONS                                   | No Total Bid Price |
| 25. Ratshihanda General Trading                              | R4900-00           |
| 26. Mufunzwani Construction                                  | R4700-00           |
| 27. Adwifari Catering And General <sup>trading</sup> trading | R4036-79           |
| 28. Ramashu supply And Services                              | R6800-00           |
| 29. Asatio Bolt And Tool                                     | R4449-00           |
| 30. Thasana General Dealer                                   | R4036-79           |
| 31. N-wa- Mengani Trading                                    | R3535-20           |
| 32. Tshilipi Tshinanne Trading                               | NO TOTAL BID PRICE |





# LIST OF BID DOCUMENTS RECEIVED

Description of goods/service mix ASPHALT of SUPPLY and delivery of LBS filler and cold  
 Tender no 4 (four) / 2015  
 Closing date 13/02/2015  
 Time 12h00

| Name of bidder                                 | Amount                |
|--|-----------------------|
| 1. KPEJ Surfacing and civils CC                | 230145 ex vat         |
| 2. MABE CHUEND Trading Enterprise              | R11902,00             |
| 3. MLTS Consulting CC                          | R172,00               |
| 4. MAFUNZWANI construction and general supply  | R200,00               |
| 5. Maenzel ERICA Trading and Projects          | R110 Price            |
| 6. Portitani construction and services         | R165,00               |
| 7. <del>MABE</del> NDI TSHI supply and Trading | R246,50               |
| 8. BEZUID TRANSPORT                            | R110 Bid Price        |
| 9. CAMSTOCK (PTY) LTD                          | R110 Bid Price        |
| 10. Ramashu supply and services                | R1170,00              |
| 11. DMK concrete Products                      | R110 Bid Price        |
| 12. Moithati Building Construction             | R600                  |
| 13. CHESTERBURY Trading and Projects 26        | R295,00               |
| 14. Striving mind Trading 687 CC               | R153-20               |
| 15. Linkie technologies                        | R110 Price            |
| 16. SENABE CIVILS                              | R572,53               |
| 17. DENNIS construction                        | RAS Per specification |
| 18. Matamela trade and service                 | R390,00               |
| 19. Nketlana Holdings (PTY) LTD                | R653,34               |
| 20. RAVHA Trading Enterprises                  | R190,00               |
| 21. ROSEMATHA construction and Projects        | R110 Price            |
| 22. VHAUVHA construction Projects              | R110 Price            |
| 23. Strelizia Consulting                       | R350                  |
| 24. Mulweli wa Livhu                           | R280                  |
| 25. Masana Social Consultants                  | R183,00               |
| 26. Mwa-Mehani Trading (PTY) LTD               | R394,95               |
| 27. IKAMVA NEMPUMELELO (PTY) LTD               | R167,57               |
| 28. Prime Pipe and products CC                 | R110 Price            |
| 29. MBHANIENI Trading CC                       | R215,00               |
| 30. BOP RATSHI HINDI General Trading           | R240,00               |
| 31. LAKE KARIQ construction                    | R500 000              |
| 32. Portia's Printers galore                   | R462,68               |
| 33. Hulelasi construction and Projects         | R345,00               |





**LIST OF BID DOCUMENTS RECEIVED**

Description of goods/service SUPPLY and delivery of concrete pipes  
 Tender no Tender NO 5/2015  
 Closing date 13 February 2015  
 Time 12H00

| Name of bidder  | Amount             |
|---|--------------------|
| 1. Delvis construction  | NO total bid price |
| 2. Mulaifa Development Project                                  | R8949.00           |
| 3. Molanco Trading enterprise                                   | R9493.62           |
| 4. Nditshi Supply and Trading                                   | R13627.20          |
| 5. Ratshinyhanda general Trading                                | R11700.00          |
| 6. Khano dzashy general Trading                                 | R10075.00          |
| 7. Thallas CC   | NO total bid price |
| 8. Portia's Printers galore                                     | R14194.28          |
| 9. Iswelepele business service project                          | R7719.30           |
| 10. Shavhie's building electrical and engineer<br>ing suppliers | NO total bid price |
| 11. Ishira tsheshu security and suppl-                          | R9789.60           |
| 12. Vhukungkura Project Management                              | NO total bid price |
| 13. Pfan general Trading  | NO total bid price |
| 14. Jeffran welding and Trading                                 | NO total bid price |
| 15. Mbahleni Trading CC   | R8305.00           |
| 16. Ndule construction of Projects                              | R14176.50          |
| 17. Dkavva NEMPURELELO  | R1307.02           |
| 18. Rosematha construction                                      | NO total bid price |
| 19. Moithati building construction cc                           | R9151.00           |
| 20. Bright Future general                                       | R9680.50           |
| 21. Ntwani Fun Trading of Project                               | R9667.50           |
| 22. MqEC Projects CC  | NO total bid price |
| 23. Samaniri Trading  | NO total bid price |
| 24. BBWP Project  | R4022.01           |
| 25. Shumani Phateni general dealer                              | R8128.48           |
| 26. Mroli's Project 3030  | R14260             |
| 27. Asatico bolt and tool                                       | R8704.83           |
| 28. Fox mind investment   | R8592.80           |
| 29. Deliblox  | NO total bid price |
| <del>30. [unclear]</del>  |                    |
| <del>31. [unclear]</del>  |                    |
| <del>32. [unclear]</del>  |                    |

Date 13/02/2015  
 Council Chapter

**LIST OF BID DOCUMENTS RECEIVED**

Description of goods/service SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF SAND  
 Tender no 6/2015  
 Closing date 13 FEBRUARY 2015  
 Time 12:00

| Name of bidder                                   | Amount       |
|--|--------------|
| 1. MOLANCO TRADING ENTERPRISE                    | R 8977,50    |
| 2. ALIGIMA TRADING                               | R 18600,00   |
| 3. TRIPLE M SAND AND TLB HIRE                    | R 2750,00    |
| 4. BEFULA TRANSPORT                              | NO BID PRICE |
| 5. MBERENGA INVESTMENTS AND PROJECTS LTD         | R 10200,00   |
| 6. MOITHATI BUILDING CONSTRUCTION                | R 8600,00    |
| 7. MUNKABE TRADING AND PROJECTS                  | R 9800,00    |
| 8. KGWAPI YA MADIBA GENERAL TRADING AND PROJECTS | NO BID PRICE |
| 9. DELVIS CONSTRUCTION                           | NO BID PRICE |
| 10. TSHILIDZI TSHINANNE TRADING                  | NO BID PRICE |
| 11. VABAVA TRADING AND PROJECTS (PTY) LTD        | NO BID PRICE |
| 12. LETTERMAN TRANSPORT AND PROJECTS CC          | NO BID PRICE |
| 13. DELIBZOX (PTY) LTD                           | NO BID PRICE |
| 14. BRIGHT FUTURE GENERAL SUPPLY                 | R 8287,00    |
| 15. CHIPHAPHU (PTY) LTD                          | R 2630,00    |
| 16. MANGAVIKII TRADING ENTERPRISE                | R 9650,00    |
| 17. ISWELOPELE ACCIDENT INVESTIGATION CC         | R 8032,50    |
| 18. N-WA-MENCAHI TRADING (PTY) LTD               | R 6800,00    |
| 19. MADUVHA HA FAMI GENERAL SERVICES (PTY) LTD   | R 8595,60    |
| 20. PFANOOLEN CONSULTING AND SERVICES (PTY) LTD  | R 6600,00    |
| 21. INDOU OFFICE MANAGEMENT TECHNOLOGY           | NO BID PRICE |
| 22. VHALUVHU CONSTRUCTION PROJECTS               | NO BID PRICE |
| 23. FM MAFUNISA TRADING AND PROJECTS (PTY) LTD   | R 8312,50    |
| 24. SHILIGS BUSINESS ENTERPRISE                  | R 350,00     |
| <del>_____</del>                                 |              |
| <del>_____</del>                                 |              |
| <del>_____</del>                                 |              |

Date: 13/02/2015  
 Council Chamber





## LIST OF BID DOCUMENTS RECEIVED

Description of goods/service SUPPLY and delivery of cement  
 Tender no 02/2015  
 Closing date 15/02/2015  
 Time 12h00

|     | Name of bidder                           | Amount     |
|-----|--|------------|
| 1.  | DELIBIOX (PTY) LTD                       | R118,80    |
| 2.  | Send them IM Trading and Projects        | R110,00    |
| 3.  | Davis Construction                       | R105,      |
| 4.  | Andiway (PTY) LTD T/A NZATA CIVILS       | R No Price |
| 5.  | BATSHIVHANDA General Trading             | R140,00    |
| 6.  | TSHIRA TSHASHA Security and SUPPLY       | R115,35    |
| 7.  | SAMAPRI Trading                          | R No Price |
| 8.  | MASALAVHO Security and General Supply    | R130,00    |
| 9.  | ZWIDOLUGA Holdings (PTY) LTD             | R 6800,00  |
| 10. | HUVUKANI Trading Enterprise CC           | R 87,00    |
| 11. | TITHISANO Projects t/A house of milan    | R No Price |
| 12. | THALLOS t/A AFAA tool and equipment      | R No Price |
| 13. | HMM Construction and general Supply      | R 87,50    |
| 14. | MARS Industrial Investments              | R 94,80    |
| 15. | TS ARCHITECT Construction and Projects   | R120       |
| 16. | THASANA General Dealer                   | R101,18    |
| 17. | Bright Future General Supply             | R 115,105  |
| 18. | Portia's Printer's Galore                | R 99,36    |
| 19. | LPP-machiba-SA Trading and Project       | R115,00    |
| 20. | MelJUKUJUKU Trading Enterprise           | R130,00    |
| 21. | John INR Trading Enterprise (PTY) LTD    | R 94,50    |
| 22. | VISIBLE Trading Enterprise               | R 349,17   |
| 23. | MROLI'S Projects 3030 (PTY) LTD          | R 90,00    |
| 24. | LESENP la Vharudwa                       | R112,00    |
| 25. | MIPYEN Industries (PTY) LTD              | R88,00     |
| 26. | SHIYATHA Construction and Projects       | R 90,00    |
| 27. | ATP Trading and Projects Pty LTD         | R108,00    |
| 28. | LICIABEX (PTY) LTD                       | R 98,00    |
| 29. | MBHAKHEMI Trading CC                     | R115,00    |
| 30. | MAMUYA HA FANI General Services          | R133,81    |
| 31. | Amy catering and services CC             | R 150,00   |
| 32. | ASATICO Bolt and tool (PTY) LTD          | R110,25    |
| 33. | LIR AFRIKAI Trading and Projects Pty LTD | R No Price |



**LIST OF BID DOCUMENTS RECEIVED**

Description of goods/service SUPPLY and delivery of cement  
 Tender no 08/2015  
 Closing date 13/02/2015  
 Time 12h00

|    | Name of bidder                              | Amount     |
|----|---|------------|
| 34 | Mamuroli General Trading                    | R 102,00   |
| 35 | Bessy General trading and Projects          | R No Price |
| 36 | Mulata Development Projects                 | R 125,00   |
| 37 | KHAYATHOMWI Building and Civil construction | R 135,98   |
| 38 | Mwamercani Trading (PTY) LTD                | R 147,58   |
| 39 | MBotalele Trade and SUPPLY                  | R 98,00    |
| 40 | MGUMDO Trading Enterprise                   | R 85,00    |
| 41 | For mind Investments (PTY) LTD              | R 88,65    |
| 42 | MULADOLI Trading Project                    | R No Price |
| 43 | Rosematha construction and Project          | R No Price |
| 44 | MDamsa Traising Enterprise                  | R 125,00   |
| 45 | Makei Projects                              | R No Price |
| 46 | ARTHUR Technologies (PTY) LTD               | R 88,00    |
| 47 | HJB Developers                              | R 144,00   |
| 48 | Katekani maintenance and Projects           | R 94,30    |
| 49 | TC21 Trading (PTY) LTD                      | R 80,00    |
| 50 | SHUMANI PHATANI General dealer              | R 109,90   |
| 51 | TSHUMAKO PHANDA development Projects        | R 99,26    |
| 52 | CHIPHAPHY (PTY) LTD                         | R 108,99   |
| 53 | AISBIE Trading Enterprise                   | R No Price |
| 54 | VHUKUMAKUMA Project Management              | R 96,00    |
| 55 | STRELIZIA consulting                        | R 291,00   |
| 56 | MOLANCO Trading Enterprise                  | R 148,00   |
| 57 | Abanet Trading                              | R 125,00   |
|    | <del>Abanet</del>                           |            |
|    | <del>Molaco</del>                           |            |
|    | <del>Abanet</del>                           |            |
|    | Date: 13/02/2015                            |            |
|    | Council Chamber                             |            |
|    |   |            |
|    |   |            |

# LIST OF BID DOCUMENTS RECEIVED

Description of goods/service  
Tender no  
Closing date  
Time

SUPPLY and delivery of stock bricks and pavings  
Tender NO 9/2015  
13 February 2015  
12H 00

| Name of bidder                         | Amount             |
|--|--------------------|
| 1. Hofaranga general Trading           | R13.49             |
| 2. Nketlana Holdings (PTI) LTD         | R18.04             |
| 3. Mangavikii Trading Enterprise       | R9.23              |
| 4. N-Wa-Mencani Trading (PTI) LTD      | R10.25             |
| 5. Arise and shine baking and Project  | No total bid price |
| 6. DR vic electronics                  | R10.55             |
| 7. NOKO MOTHEP9 SECURITY PROJECTS      | NO total bid price |
| 8. Portia's Printers galore            | R1261.00           |
| 9. Marc blessing Construction          | R818.00            |
| 10. Ndou office and IS architects      | No total bid price |
| 11. Mberengwa investments              | R7.55              |
| 12. Khuliso construction               | R5.45              |
| 13. Tshira Tshashu security            | R8963.14           |
| 14. Triple on sand and T16 hire        | R4.90              |
| 15. Arthur Technologies (PTI) LTD      | R7.30              |
| 16. Dora & Motgaetsi Trading           | No total bid price |
| 17. Shilas business enterprise         | R6.40              |
| 18. John JNR Trading enterprise        | No total bid price |
| 19. Mulaifa development Projects       | R11.40             |
| 20. Musukume investment holdings       | R10.73             |
| 21. KATEKANI MAINTENANCE & PROJECT     | NO BID PRICE       |
| 22. DELIBLOX (PTI) LTD                 | NO BID PRICE       |
| 23. TSHEDZA CONCRETE ART               | NO BID PRICE       |
| 24. MUDUMELA TRADE AND GENERAL PROJECT | 11.4               |
| 25. ALUVUKENI TRADING Enterprise cc    | R10.00             |
| 26. MDULE CONSTRUCTION & PROJECTS CC   | R15,86             |
| 27. MIBONALELO TRADE AND Supply        | R9,59              |
| <del>28. [unclear]</del>               |                    |
| <del>29. [unclear]</del>               |                    |
| <del>30. [unclear]</del>               |                    |
| Date: 13/02/2015                       |                    |



