

Ref:.....  
 Attention:.....  
 2020-01-20  
 MAKHADO MUNICIPALITY  
 COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

## List of bid documents received

Description of goods/services PANEL OF SERVICE PROVIDERS FOR SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF NEWSPAPER FOR THE PERIOD OF 12 MONTHS  
 Tender No. 67 OF 2019  
 Closing date 20 JANUARY 2020  
 Time 12H00

Name of bidder	Amount
1. Nukona Qhivi Trading	R 305 - 70
2. Cuius Tent chairs and tables hire	R NO BID PRICE
3. Serving SA Projects	R 582 - 00
4. Nkebileng TRADING Enterprise	R 262 - 77
5. Morsmad Trading And facilities	NO bid price
6. Thenjeni Holdings	R 79 999 - 00
7. Thagwana Communications	R 284, 08
8 (Metshikouhela) Xibano Projects	R 28 586 - 68
9. TM Junior Trading	R NO bid Price
10. Joanda Trading Enterprise	R 422 585
11. Wama Business Enterprise	R 271, 71
12. Emco Trading And Projects	R 252 - 90
13. Sundani Trading Enterprise	R NO Bid price
14. Malekuty Phuthi	R 331 20
15. David Electrical Supply	R NO Bid Price
16. HMM Construction & Generals	R 316 - 12
17. Kwefa Business Enterprise	R 312 53

## List of bid documents received

Description of goods/services

Tender No.

Closing date

Time

Panel of service providers for supply  
and delivery of newspapers for the 12 months  
67 of 2019  
20 January 2020  
12H00

Name of bidder	Amount
18. Rams Mushavi General Trading	R 310 -11
19. Musima Trading & Projects	R NO Bid Price
20. Kuvha M Mdihlu Supply	R 273,350
21. Zedek Trading 312	R NO Bid Price
22. Monama Cooler	R 422.88
23. Daclikwa Transport & Trans	R 326.10
24. Thapelam (PTY) Ltd	R 124.20
25. Kenmashaba Projects	R 287.02
26. Pertma Trading Enterprise	R 318.00
27. Riakona SECURITY Trading	R NO Bid Price
28. Lihone Investment	R 304.84
29. Bluepace Consulting & Proje	R 222.00
30. Nkomati Investments (PTY)	R NO Bid Price
31. Maho Holdings	R 261.56
32. Phiri Phiri General Trading	R NO Bid Price
33. FEP Trading And Projects	R 266.75
34. Mufhatutshedai Construction	R 239.50

Ref:.....

Attention:.....

2020 -01- 20

MAKHADO MUNICIPALITY

COMMENTS & INFORMATION


**List of bid documents received**

Description of goods/services Panel of service providers to supply and delivery of newspapers for the 12 months

Tender No. 67 of 2019

Closing date 20 January 2020

Time 12 H00

Name of bidder	Amount
35. Mashapane Construction	R 325.38
36. Mulma Engineering Pty)	R NO bid price
37. Chosen Multipurpose	R 86 986.00
38. Revo Supply And Services	R 349.000
39. Tshisphawe Trading	R NO Bid price
40. M C SEOG Trading & Projects	R NO bid Price
41. JSD Trading Enterprise	R NO bid price
42. Vhanda Service Trade	R NO bid price
43. Rasalanavho Security	R NO Bid price
44. Tallbytes	R 266.90
45. Bruchell	R 260, 80
46. Rendz Ten Group (Pty) Ltd	R 266, 90
47. Seshas Catering Services	R NO Bid price
48. Bitebogo Tsa ga Mathebula	R 318.50
49. Mni i a dunga Catering & projects	R 28 810. 84
	
	20/January/2020

20/01/2020