
AWARDED BIDS

MAKHADO LOCAL MUNICIPALITY

FINANCIAL YEAR 2018/19

JULY 2018 TO JUNE 2019

NO BID NUMBER DESCRIPTION AWARDED COMPANY AMOUNT

1
02 OF 2018 SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF TOILET PAPERS FOR PERIOD OF THREE YEARS

FARANANI SECURITY SERVICS (PTY)LTD 205.50R                                                  

KHARENDWE INVESTMENTS (PTY)LTD 205.50R                                                  

MULTI SYSTEM GROUP 205.50R                                                  
MASEWA CONSTRUCTION AND GENERAL SUPPLY 205.50R                                                  

TSHIKURUFU TRADING ENTERPRISE 205.50R                                                  

2 03 OF 2018

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PROTECTIVE CLOTHING FOR MAKHADO LOCAL EMPLYEES FOR 

PERIOD OF THREE YEARS SILAYE GENERAL TRADING  RATES 

CULIS TENT CHAIRS AND TABLE HIRE  RATES 

LONDOLA TRADERS  RATES 

NESBEN TRADING  RATES 

MICHAEL MAKHADO AND ASSOCIATES PTY LTD  RATES 

MIRANT  RATES 

VHAHANDIVHU BUSINESS TRADING  RATES 

MUSPAT TRADING

LUDRICK CONSTRUCTION AND PROJECTS (PTY)LTD  RATES 

3 04 0F 2018 SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PHOTO COPING PAPERS FOR THE PERIOD OF THREE YEARS BAXOSAT (PTY)LTD 256.87R                                                  

TAMUTEMU PROJECTS AND SKILLS 256.87R                                                  

MUDZULA SUPPLY SERVICES RATES

ARCHOWE TRADING ENTERPRISE 256.87R                                                  

FHIDZO CONSTRUCTION (PTY)LTD 256.87R                                                  

4 10 OF 2018

PUSHING NOTICES AND ADVERTS ON DIFFERENT NEWSPAPERS FOR THR PERIOD OF THREE 

YEARS LADY KATISI SUPPLY AND CONSTRUCTIONS RATES

MUNGONA HOLDINGS RATES

5 12 OF 2018
SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT END USER EQUIPMENT FOR THE PERIOD OF THREE YEARS Yello Solution Technology CC

RATES

Best Enough Trading and Projects 412 CC RATES

6 13 OF 2018

APPOINTMENT AS SERVICE PROVIDER FOR MAINTENANCE AND REPAIRS OF LAPTOPS, 

DESKTOPS, PRINTERS AND SCANNERS FOR THE PERIOD OF TWO (02) YEARS
Nambiti Technologies

828.00R                                                  

7 14 OF 2018

POINT TO POINT WIRELESS NETWORK FOR THE PERIOD OF THREE YEARS CATICA PROJECTS (PTY)LTD

9 939 523.00R                                        

8

21 OF 2018
APPOINTMENT OF  CONTRACTOR FOR CONSTRUCTIONNN OF PIESANGHOEK TO KHUNDA 

ROAD PHASE 4
T AND C CIVILS (PTY)LTD 14 107 366.65R                                      

9

23 OF 2018 WATERVAAL SPORTFACILITE

DIGES GROUP CC 10 971 330.40R                                      

10

24 OF 2018
MAINTENANCE AND OPERATION OF ALL COUNCIL AIR CONDITIONER FOR THE PERIOD OF 

THREE YEARS
BELTA SERVICES 7 848.00R                                               



NO BID NUMBER DESCRIPTION AWARDED COMPANY AMOUNT

MAGEKHA ELECTRICAL JV MUDZUSI WA VHUTALI 7 848.00R                                               

MASGAC TRADING ENTERPRISE JV MLK ENGINEERING AND 

CONSULTANT 7 848.00R                                               

11
25 OF 2018 CONSTRUCTION OF XITACINI TO JIWENI ACCESS ROAD PHASE 2

NECKMAY TRADING ENTERPRISE 12 604 067.85R                                      

12
26 OF 2018

OCCUPATIONAL MEDICAL SERVICES FOR MAKHADO LOCAL MUNICIPALITY EMPLOYEES 

FOR PERIOD OF THREE YEARS AFRIMED BUSINESS SOLUTIONS RATES

13
27 OF 2018 SUPPLY AND DELIVERY FUEL LUBRICATS FOR SMALL EQUIPMENT

CLASS A TRADING 514 RATES

NORTHBULK PETROLEUM WHOLESALER RATES

14
28 OF 2018 CLINICAL PSYCHOLOGIST MEDICAL SERVICES FOR THE PERIOD OF THREE YEARS

AFRIMED BUSINESS SOLUTIONS RATES

15
31 OF 2018 CONTRUCTION OF TSHIKWARANI/MAVHELA AND ZAMEKOMSTA

MODA WOMEN PROJECTS R28 100 400.90

16 32 OF 2018 SUPPLY AND DELIVER,RETROFIT,INSTAL AND COMMISSION OF MIDHINGE E T Tshipota Electrical Contractor R1 993 648.51 

17
33 OF 2018 SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF 11 KVA RING MAIN UNITS FOR THE FINANCIAL 2019 Conan-Consulting and Projects JV Noyaba Electrical Engineering (Pty) Ltd

R1 962 000.00 

18

34 OF 2018
SERVICE PROVIDER FOR DEVELOPMENT OF ADDITIONAL WASTE DISPOSAL CELL (CELL 2) 

AT THE NEW MAKHADO LANDFILL SITE 
Mulaifa Development Projects

R 2 635 798.00 

19

 37 OF 2018 CONSTRUCTION OF MUDIMELI BRIDGE AND ACCESS ROAD PHASE 3

TSHIDAHO CONSTRUCTION SERVICES 11 382 181.58R                                      

20

39 OF 2018
REPAIR OF HEAVY MACHINERY AND TRUCKS AND SUPPLY OF HYDRILIC FOR THE PERIOD 

OF TWO YEARS
Neo Toris

R           2 012.50

21

42 OF 2018
APPOINTMENT AS SERVICE PROVIDER FOR SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF BATTERIES FOR THE 

PERIOD OF TWO YEARS 
Cesor (Pty) Ltd

R         104 756.00

22

43 OF 2018
APPOINTMENT AS SERVICE PROVIDER FOR WELDING OF LIGHT VEHICLES, TRUCKS, HEAVY 

MACHINERY AND TRACTOR FOR THE PERIOD OF TWO (02) YEARS
Mamosholagae Trading and Projects 30

R          2 398.90

23

45 OF 2018
REFURBISHMENT OF 5MVA TRANSFORMER FOR MAKHADO LOCAL MUNICIPALITY FOR THE 

FINANCIAL YEAR 2018/19
Noele Trading CC R      1 519 092.50 

24
46 OF 2018

SUPPLY,DELIVERY,INSTAL AND COMMISSIONING OF 1 X 5MVA TRANSFORMER AT CRIKET 

CLUB SUBSTATION FOR MAKHADO LOCAL MUNICIPALITY
Conan-Consulting and Projects JV Noyaba Electrical Engineering (Pty) Ltd

R      1 850 000.00 

25
49 OF 2018

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF SKIP BINS TO MAKHADO LOCAL MUNICIPALITY
Fulufhelo Textile Manufacturing and Services

R          512 500.00 

26 50 OF 2018 SUPPLY  AND DELIVERY OF DIARIES AND CALENDERS FOR 2019 MUTHUMUNI CORPORATE GIFTS 690 805.00R                                           

27
51 OF 2018

SUPPLY,DELIVERY ANDINSTALLATION OF 50KVA STABY GENERATOR AT MAKHADO 

MUNICIPALITY WATER REGIONAL OFFICE
Magekha Electrical Projects

R         574 425.00 

28
56 OF 2018

APPOINTMENT OF TURNKEY SERVICES FOR THE DESIGN AND  UPGRADING OF TSHAKHUMA 

MARKET
Tshashu Consulting and Projects Managers JV

R      4 507 492.06



NO BID NUMBER DESCRIPTION AWARDED COMPANY AMOUNT

29
18 OF 2018

PANEL OF MUNICIPAL EVENTS RESOURCES PROVIDERS FOR THE PERIOD OF TWELVE 

MONTHS Various service provider Rates

30 20 OF 2018 SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF STATIONERY Various service provider Rates

31 44 OF 2018

APPIONTMENT OF A PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER:ADDITIONAL INCOMER INTAKE POINTS FOR 

MAKHADO LOCAL MUNICIPALITY MAIN SUBSTATION FOR THE PERIOD OF TWO YEARS NSK ELETRICAL AND CONSTRUCTION MANAGERS (PTY) LTD 12% in professional fees

32 47 OF 2018

APPOINTMENT OF PANEL OF CONSUTANTS FOR PROFESSIONAL CIVIL ENGINEERING 

RELATED SERVICES FOR THE PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS WHICH SHALL BE AS AND WHEN 

REQUIRED Infraburo civil and Engineering Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Voningela Consulting and projects Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Diges Group CC Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Victory Development Projects Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Shumba Engineering Services Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Ntsako Tiyani and Associates Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

MVE Consulting Engineers Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Nemorango Consulting Engineers Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

TM Afri Engineering Services Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Dane Projects (pty)ltd Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Mamadi and Company Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Tshino consulting Engineers Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Botshabelo Consulting Engineers Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

SA Quest Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Tshashu Consulting and project managers Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Sizeya Consulting Engineers Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

MJT Consulting Engineers 01 (PTY)ltd Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Samtak Consulting Services Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Morula cosulting Engineers and project managers Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Mont Consulting Engineers Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Xilalelo Project Managers Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

T2- Tech Engineers(pty)ltd Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Tshedza Consulting Engineers Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Ralema Consulting Engineers (pty)ltd Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Muteo consulting Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

TMS Consulting Engineers and projects management Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Dikgabo consulting Engineers Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Phamela Engineering services Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

EKS Consulting Engineers Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

AES Consulting Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

Mulalo Consulting Rates(calculated as per ECSA)

33 48 OF 2018

SUPPLY DELIVER,INSTALL AND COMMISSIONING OF ELECTRONIC CEMETERY 

MANAGEMENT STSTEM Luraps Trading (pty)ltd R 970 000.00 Vat Exclusive

34 52 OF 2018 SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ROAD MARKING  MACHINE Nrath (pty)ltd R 932 400.00 Vat Exclusive

35 53 OF 2018 SUPPLY AND DELIVERY BATTERY CHARGER Intro vert and vertex 8 (pty)ltd R200 000.00 Vat Exclusive

36 54 0F 2018 SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF CTVT UNITS (12KV) POINT ON SERVICES R400 000.00 Vat Exclusive

37 55 OF 2018

APPOINTMENT OF A SERVICES PROVIDER/CONSULTANTS TO RENDER ASSIGNMENT 

FORINTERNAL AUDIT UNIT MAKHADO MUNICIPALTY FOR THE PERIOD OF THREE YEARS Jofani Accounting and Consulting Rates

Shumba Inc Rates

TNK Business solutions cc Rates

Victorius Chartered Accountants Inc Rates
MNB Chartered Accountants Rates



NO BID NUMBER DESCRIPTION AWARDED COMPANY AMOUNT
Tic and Mend (pty)ltd Rates

38 71 of 2018 Development of Dzanani Park Mvuno geo-enviromental civil and construction R 1 071 900.00

39 72 of 2018 Review LED Strategy for Local Economic Development for Makhado Municipality Urban-econ development economists (pty)ltd R 190 906.00

40 73 of 2018 Sale of council land ERF 3456 Louis Trichardt Extension 2 Banyana enterprise R 1 200 000.00

41 74 of 2018 Sale of council land ERF 1953 Louis Trichardt Extension 2 Trrendy tiles and sanitary ware R 1 850 000.00

42 13 of 2019
Supply ,delivery of materials, labour and construction of pavement at Makhado local municipality 

mechanical workshop
Mvuno geo-enviromental civil and construction

R 985 625.00

43 14 of 2019
Supply ,delivery of materials, labour and construction of pavement at Makhado local municipality- Dzanani 

Reginal Office
Zwashu business

R 225 000.00

44 17 of 2019 Supply and delivery of pedestrian roller Goldiflo (pty)ltd R 434 700.00

45 69/2018
Supply, Delivery and Erection Of High Masts In Various Villages:  Muraleni, Maebane, Mavhunga Rdp, 

Rabali, Mpheni, Waterval, Ramukhuba And Tsianda
Magekha electrical projects

R 2 386 135.00

46 58 of 2018 Appointment of contractor to upgrade the beufort 22KV west line Risima project management
R 777 635.75

47 76 of 2018 Provision of Data Cleansing Services Aligned concepts risk and adversory services R 272.50

Data space Technology R 272.50

Ipes-utility management services R 272.50

48 20 of 2019 Appointment for development of makhado local municipality land use scheme for a period of two years Matete and associates consultants
R 2 530 235.75

49 22 of 2019 Preparation of Makhado local municipality spatial development Indalo development consultant R 903 262.93

50 67 of 2019 Supply and delivery of truck tractor (horse) and trailer for the makhado local municipality 1 Daisy general dealer 001 R 2 691 728.89

51 11 of 2019 Appointment of panel of service provider for skills development provider) for the period of three years Abakholwe community developers cc
R 6 620.00

Arehone consulting R 13 420.00

Regenesys management (pty)ltd R 335 800.00

South african institute of learning R 133 200.00

Masana social consultants R 116 903.00

Excellent minds institute (pty)ltd R 76 764.00

52 68 of 2018 Supply, fitting and repairs of tyres for the period of two (02) years Temitope and tshilidzi trading Rates

Du toit's bande Rates

Lugani trading enterprise cc t/c Tiger wheel and tyre Rates

53 19 of 2018 Development of Makhado Local municipality Land scheme for the period of three years Matete and associates consultants R 2 530 235.75

54 16 of 2019 Cell phone and Tablet contract package for the period of three years Tawa Trading cc R 10 586.00

55 65 of 2018 Supply and delivery of petrol engine oils for  the period of two (02) years Chosen f trading R 12 886.02

Etrostax (pty)ltd R 14 818.92

Goldiflo (pty)ltd R 12 886.02

Exilite 349 cc R 12 886.02

Wama bsiness Enterprise (pty)ltd R 12 886.02

Talifhani holdings (pty)ltd R 12 886.02

Reckson solution (pty)ltd R 12 886.02

56 75 of 2018 Provision of Banking Services for a period of five (05) years First Rnd bank limited Rates

57 59  of 2018 Appointment of contractor to upgrade the mountain 22KV line AVAX SA 222 CC R2 499 709,82

58 21 of 2019 Panel of demarcation of sites and township establishment for a period of three years Ngoto Development Consultants Rates

Mahlori Development Consultants Rates

Acute Inovation Rates

Matete and associates consultants Rates

59 23 of 219 Panel of professional surveyors for a period of three years Rolous Geomatics  Solutions Rates

N Khoza Land Suveyors Rates

MM Geomatics (pty)ltd Rates

60 64 of 2018 Supply and delivery of diesel engine oils for the period of two (02) years Exilite 349 cc Rates

Safe keepers Security Rates

Siyanincenga Construction and Projects Rates

Lucy general Suppliers Rates

N and C Civild Rates



NO BID NUMBER DESCRIPTION AWARDED COMPANY AMOUNT
Zwashu Trading and Projects cc Rates



NO BID NUMBER DESCRIPTION AWARDED COMPANY AMOUNT
1 Daisy General Rates

TMJ Construction Rates

Wama Business Enterprise Rates

Teleside Technologies Rates

Rasoka (pty)ltd Rates

Wakhuliso Investment (pty)ltd Rates

Northbulk Petroleum Rates

C Matodzi Projects Rates

Mungona Holdingd (pty)ltd Rates

Wauluga (pty)ltd Rates

Reckson solution (pty)ltd Rates

Mudani Petrolium Rates

Ntwani Funi Trading and Projects (pty)ltd Rates

Mavenas (Pty)ltd Rates

61 35 of 2018 Suply and Delivery of Eletrical  Materials for a period three years Luraps Trading (pty)ltd Quotation Basis

Mafunzwani Construction and General Supply Quotation Basis

Bics Enginnering and Supply (pty)ltd Quotation Basis

Tsuamo Civils Quotation Basis

Madeph Technial Services Quotation Basis

HTE Construction Quotation Basis

Magekha Electrical Quotation Basis

Free Horizon (Pty)ltd Quotation Basis

Labstyre (pty)ltd Quotation Basis

Murangu Muvuledzi Trading and Projects Quotation Basis

Gerson Matamela Holdings Quotation Basis

Firm Supply Trading (pty)ltd Quotation Basis

Team Lutosh Trading Enterprise Quotation Basis

Ludrics Construction Quotation Basis

Goldiflo (pty)ltd Quotation Basis

1 Daisy General Quotation Basis

Wauluga (pty)ltd Quotation Basis

Mudumela trade and General Projects Quotation Basis

Binofusion (pty)ltd Quotation Basis

Neps Fire Services and Supply (pty)ltd Quotation Basis

Dreamfinders and Projects 133 Quotation Basis

MLTS Quotation Basis

Phenium Trading and Projects Quotation Basis

Nergy Construction Quotation Basis

Vhangwena Business Enterprise Quotation Basis

62 10 of 2019 Supply and delivery of library books Quarts Trading Quotation Basis

BKS Educational Supplies T/A Best book Quotation Basis

Shutter and Shooter Publishers Quotation Basis
63 66 of 2018 Supplyn and delivery of hydraulic oils for a period of two years Eyethu Royal Solutions Rates

 Wama Business Enterprise (Pty) Ltd Rates

 Zwashu Trading Project Rates

 Exilite 349 cc Rates

 N and C Civil Rates

 Ramasoka (Pty) Ltd Rates

 Mapondho and Projects (Pty) Ltd Rates

 Cloud One Trading  Rates

 Kgoroshi Construction and General Projects Rates

 Stodzi Trading (Pty) Ltd Rates

 Mudani Petroleum (Pty) Ltd Rates

 Ramagwalivha Trading Rates

 Wauluga (Pty) Ltd Rates

 Northbulk Petroleum Wholesaler (Pty) Ltd Rates

 Tshisima Holdings Rates

64 63 of 2018 Supply and delivery of auto transmission fluid for a period of two years  Chabal Solutions (Pty) Ltd Rates
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 Etrosrax (Pty) Ltd Rates

 Wama Business Enterprise (Pty) Ltd Rates

 Ehud Investment (Pty) Ltd Rates

 Mudani Petroleum (Pty) Ltd Rates

 N&C Civils CC Rates

 Baxosat Consulting (Pty) Ltd Rates

TMJ Consultant Rates

65 62 of 2018 Supply and delivery of gearbox oils for a period of two years       Wama Business Enterprise Rates

     Zwashu Trading Project Rates

     MMS Business Agency Rates

      Ramasoka (Pty)Ltd Rates

      Mudani Petroleum (Pty)Ltd Rates

      TMJ Construction Rates

66 Reapir of lowvoltage  Lefhumo Lwa Barema Trading Enterprise (Pty)Ltd Rates

Madz Electrical Rates

 Humphrey Electrical and Projects Rates

 Avax SA 222 CC Rates

 Hwali Business Enterprise Rates


